
K J Somaiya Medical College 

MBBS batch 2021-22 

Foundation course Time Table 

Time Competency 
no 

 

Topic 

 
31st January 2022 

 

10.00 am 1.4 Dean’s address 
 
Rules and regulations of the 
institution 

 
12th February 2022 

 

9.00 - 10.00 1.10 History of medicine  

 
 

 
10.00 – 11.00 

 
Module 4B 

 

White coat ceremony 

 
11.00 – 1.00 

 

4.12 

 

 
Group learning and group 
dynamics 

 
1.00 – 1.30 
 

  
Lunch 

 
1.30 – 2.00 

 
1.4 

 

Presentation by Anti Ragging 

committee 

 

 
2.00 – 4.00 

 
2.3 & 2.8 

 
Bio-safety and universal 
precautions 
Immunization requirements of 
Health care professionals 
 

4.00 – 5.00 Module 6 Sports & ECA 
 

 

 

 

 



 
26th February 2022 

 

 
9.00 - 10.00 

 
4.1, 4.2, 4.3 

 
Concept of Professionalism and 
ethics  
Consequences of unprofessional 
and unethical behavior 
Compassion, altruism, integrity, 
duty, responsibility and trust as 
core values of the physician’s work 
Importance of honesty and respect 
during interaction with peers, 
seniors, faculty, other health care 
workers and patients 
 

 
10.00 – 11.00 

 
1.1 & 1.2 

 
Expectation of profession from its 
members 
Roles and responsibilities of 
doctors 
Gender sensitivity 
 

 
11.00 – 12.00 

 
1.1 & 1.2 

 
Expectation of society & patient 
from doctors 
 

 
12.00 – 1.00 
 

 
1.10 

 
Alternate systems of Medicine 

 
1.00 – 1.30 

  
Lunch 
 

 
1.30 – 4.00 

 
2.4,2.5,2.6 
&2.7 

 
Handling and safe disposal of 
Biohazardous materials  
Hand washing and use of personal 
protective equipment 
Response to needle stick injuries 
Biomedical Waste segregation 
(BMW), & process of management 
of BMW  
 

 
4.00 – 5.00 

 
Module 6 

 
Sports & ECA 
 

 

 



 
12th March 2022 

 

 
9.00 - 11.00 

 
1.5 

 
Orientation to the college campus, 
facilities, faculty, administrative 
structure, support systems and 
processes of the institution. 
(Campus tour) 
 

 
11.00 - 1.00 

 
4.13 & 4.14 

 
Learning pedagogy and its role in 
learning skills 
Different methods of self-directed 
learning including simulation-based 
learning 
 

 
1.00 - 1.30  
 

  
Lunch 

 
1.30 - 4.00 
 

 
5.4 

 
Computer skills 

 
4.00 – 5.00 
 

 
Module 6 

 
Sports & ECA 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 
26th March 2022 

 

 
9.00 - 10.00 

 
4.6 & 4.10 

 
Understanding and respecting 
cultural diversities  
Interpersonal relationship while 
working in a health care team 
 

 
10.00 - 11.00 

 
1.3 

 
Expectations of the students from 
the Nation, society, Institution, 
peers, colleagues and patients and 
vice versa 
 

 
11.00 - 1.00  
 

 
4.5 

 
Sensitization to persons with 
disabilities 
 

 
1.00 - 1.30 
 

  
Lunch 

 
1.30 - 4.00 

 
4.15 

 
Collaborative learning (peer 
assisted learning) and assessment 
driven learning 
 

 
4.00 – 5.00 
 

 
Module 6 

 
Sports & ECA 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 
9th April 2022 

 

 
9.00 - 10.00 
 

 
4.4 

 
Working in a health care team 

  

 
10.00 - 11.00 
 

  
Community based learning 

 
11.00 - 1.00  

 
4.11 

 

Interpersonal communication 

Role of mentoring  

 

 
1.00 - 1.30 
 

  
Lunch 

 
1.30 - 4.00 

 
3.1, 3.2, 3.3, 
3.4, 3.5 & 3.6 

 

National Health Priorities and 

policies 

 

  

 
4.00 – 5.00 
 

 
Module 6 

 
Sports & ECA 

 

 
23rd April 2022 

 

 
9.00 - 11.00 
 

 
2.2 

 

First Aid 

 
11.00 - 1.00 
 

 
4.7 

 

Stress Management 

 
1.00 - 1.30  
 

  
Lunch 

 
1.30 - 4.00 
 

 
4.9 

 
Time management 

 
4.00 – 5.00 

 
Module 6 
 

 
Sports & ECA 

 

 



 
11th June 2022 

 

 
9.00 - 10.00 
 

  

Relating to Patients Experience of 

the disease  

 

 
10.00 - 11.00 

 
5.1 

 

Communication with patients 

 

 
11.00 - 1.00  
 

 
1.6 & 1.7 

 

Career pathways & personal 

growth  

 

 
1.00 - 1.30  
 

  
Lunch 

 
1.30 - 4.00 
 

 
5.4 

 
Computer skills 

 
4.00 – 5.00 
 

 
Module 6 

 
Sports & ECA 

 

 
25th June 2022 

 

 
9.00 - 11.00 
 

 
2.1 

 

Basic life Support 

 
11.00 - 1.00 
 

  
Principles of Primary care (general 
care and community-based care)  
 

 
1.00 - 1.30  
 

  
Lunch 

 
1.30 - 4.00 
 

 
5.2 & 5.3 

 

Language Enhancement 

(Local/English/both)  

 

 
4.00 – 5.00 
 

 
Module 6 

 
Sports & ECA 

 

 



 
9th July 2022 

 

 
9.00 - 10.00 
 

 
2.9 

 

Documentation & medical records 

 

 
10.00 – 11.00 
 

 
1.8 & 1.9 

 

Family practice  

Healthcare system and its delivery 

 

 
11.00 – 12.00 
 

 
5.5 

 

Use of online resources 

 
12.00 – 1.00 
 

 
4.8 

 
Yoga 

 
1.00 – 1.30 
 

  
Lunch 

 
1.30 – 4.00 

 
5.2, 5.3 

 

Language Enhancement (Local / 

English / both) 

 

 
4.00 – 5.00 
 

 
Module 6 

 
Sports & ECA 

 

 

 
23rd July 2022 

 

 
9.00 - 1.00 
 

  

UHTC Visit 

 
1.00 – 1.30 
 

  
Lunch 

 
1.30 – 4.00 
 

  

Pandemic module F1 

 

 
4.00 – 5.00 
 

 
Module 6 

 
Sports & ECA 

 


